
MAP & PARCEL NUMBER REPUTED OWNER(S) LOCATION
 BID AMOUNT + 
RECORDING 

01-21-0269-270 1400 Market St Holdings, LLC 1400 Market Street  NO BID 

01-22-0826-012. 1401 Market St LLC 101 S 15th Street  $         4,019.85 

06-19-1643-142. Smith, Norma J 361 E Street  $     143,771.09 

06-20-1798-236. Barnes, Joan A 425 N West Street  $       79,030.09 

09-11-3005-076. Osborn, John Belle Vista Drive  $       22,639.55 

09-15-1293-016. Engel, Jack I Front Street  $         6,939.75 
09-16-1050-065. Bryson, George Roy, Jr. & Dorothy E. 13 E Locust Street  $       97,974.23 

09-16-1051-040. Barton, Shaina R 45 Creekside Drive  $       53,297.27 

10-19-1606-018.-TR07386 Acevedo, Natalie Q 514 Salem Acres  $         1,002.00 

10-20-1844-082. Shoemaker, Kelly J 5008 Erbs Bridge Road  $     107,061.63 

13-23-0549-072. Cruz, Alfredo 2303 Gettysburg Road  $       12,800.23 

13-23-0549-073. Cruz, Alfredo 2305 Gettysburg Road  $       18,397.59 

13-23-0549-234.-U-106-7 Green Terra Realty, LLC 2109 Cedar Run Drive  $     117,997.75 

15-07-0483-018.-TR05754 Johnson, William 113 Conodoguinet M.E.  $         1,117.00 

17-24-0787-091. Stoner, Dennis J 325 E Marble Street  $     227,896.19 

21-06-0015-002.-TR00006 Walker, Victoria & Christopher 57 Aspen Lane  $         3,517.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR04231 Torres-Rios, Yareliz & Jorge Arocho 31 Cypress Lane  $         4,417.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR04603 Rodilosso, Anthony III & Jodene Rodilosso 7 Aspen Lane  $         3,827.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR04606 Bechtel, Sheri 14 Magnolia Lane  $         2,617.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR07550 Oriheula, Rfail 40 Redwood Lane  $         1,265.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR07901 Sepulveda, Jonathan Rosario & Cassie Macatee 23 Aspen Lane  $         3,217.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR08234 Moore, Jayson 6 Magnolia Lane  $         1,244.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR09136 Alleyne, Duquan 8 Redwood Lane  $         1,485.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR09172 Bindus, Amanda 42 Redwood Lane  $            573.00 

21-06-0015-002.-TR09248 Wilson, Samantha 43 Creekside Lane  $            556.00 

21-17-2692-002. Krum, Margaret A 26 Evergreen Lane  $     348,699.05 

23-31-2187-054.-TR01260 Hood, Tammy 32 Center Street, Lot 13  $            839.00 

23-32-2338-038.-TR09393 Duncan, Heidi 3 Park Street  $         1,186.00 

26-23-0541-001. Pelorus Properties, LLC 16th Street  $         2,525.33 

26-23-0541-016. Trusted Source Capital, LLC 129 16th Street  $       20,403.83 

26-23-0541-130. Kirsch, Kevin Lee E 1517 Kathryn Street  $     171,819.43 

29-15-1251-056.-TR04480 Neidigh, Crystal 141 Tower Circle  $         1,323.00 

29-15-1251-056.-TR05642 Hoppe, Daniel & Morgan 115 Tower Circle  $         2,877.00 

38-07-0463-015.-TR05623 Rupp, Heath 319 Bahama Circle  $         1,424.00 

38-08-0565-138. Rockville Entertainment $500.00 Abanonded Bid Fee July Breeze Drive  NO BID 

38-19-1625-008.-TR01729 Ciecierski, Kayla & Roger 207 Key West Boulevard  $            433.00 

38-19-1625-008.-TR01980 Gerald, Patricia A 49 Sarasota Circle  $            987.00 

38-19-1625-008.-TR03305 Robinson, Cassandra 226 Key West Boulevard  $            794.00 

38-19-1625-008.-TR09694 Holmes, Rojohn 424 Hilton Head Avenue  $            727.00 

40-23-0592-035.-TR02170 Black, Brandy Nicole 98 Fairview Street, Lot 2  NO BID 

40-23-0592-035.-TR02808 Russell, Taylor R 99 Fairview Street, Lot 5  NO BID 

40-24-0759-001.-UE1---1 Marchi, Margaret L & Camille M. 21 Abbey Court  $     108,915.03 

42-30-2108-143.-TR10784 Day, Michael J 5546 Rolo Court  $            390.00 

46-09-0515-005.-TR09627 Farner, Brent 144 Big Spring Terrace  $         1,003.00 
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